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Notice of Intent to Award 
 
 
October 26, 2016 
 
 
IFB Number:  17-15, Large Water Meters & Parts 
 
To Our Valued Vendors, 
 
Thank you for participating and submitting a bid on the above solicitation.  We appreciate your 
interest in doing business with the City of Glendale and trust that there will be opportunities in the 
future for your continued participation. 
 
The City has completed the evaluation process of the bids received.  The recommended award for 
this solicitation is to Dana Kepner Company, Inc., whose bid was determined to be the lowest, 
most responsive, responsible bid that meets the specifications stated in the bid. 
 
If you have any questions, or would like further information about the award, please contact me on 
or before November 2, 2016. 
 
Sincerely,  

 
Connie Schneider, C.P.M. 
Procurement – Budget & Finance Division 
(623) 930-2868 
CSchneider@Glendaleaz.com  
 
 
 
 

 

 

mailto:CSchneider@Glendaleaz.com


De
sc

rip
tio

n

Bi
dd

er

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Revised Bid Schedule -
Addendum 1

Est. Qty
Conditional Acceptance

5.1.1 25
1 ½” OMNI T2 Turbo 
Meter

808 20200 394.1 9852.5 729.25 18231.25 NO BID 683 17075

5.1.2 40
2” OMNI T2 Turbo 
Meter 905 36200 377.63 15105.2 856.22 34248.8 NO BID 806 32240

5.1.3 3
3” OMNI T2 Turbo 
Meter 1134 3402 407.94 1223.82 1055.33 3165.99 NO BID 998 2994

5.1.4 3
4” OMNI T2 Turbo 
Meter 1641 4923 452.39 1357.17 2009.86 6029.58 NO BID 1920 5760

5.1.5 3
6” OMNI T2 Turbo 
Meter 3916 11748 672.88 2018.64 3580.62 10741.86 NO BID 3435 10305

5.1.6 1
3” OMNI C2 Compound 
Meter 2389 2389 1427.22 1427.22 1503.82 1503.82 NO BID 1435 1435

5.1.7 1
4” OMNI C2 Compound 
Meter 3644 3644 1769.22 1769.22 2577.1 2577.1 NO BID 2470 2470

5.1.8 1
6” OMNI C2 Compound 
Meter 5197 5197 3102.22 3102.22 4417.02 4417.02 NO BID 4250 4250

5.1.9 1
10” OMNI T2 with 
flange connect, without 
strainer – 2” 740 740 603.46 603.46 6518.58 6518.58 NO BID 677 677
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IFB 17-15 LARGE WATER METERS & PARTS - BID TAB 
10/13/2016

National Meter & 
Automation

Sensus USA
HD Supply & 
Waterworks

Dana Kepner
Zenner Performance 

Meters, Inc.

5.1.10 25

3” OMNI H2 Fire 
Hydrant Meter with 
national standard fire 
hose thread male 
adapter and female 
swivel coupling

869 21725 502 12550 1050.48 26262 NO BID 1163 29075

5.1.11 1
5/8” x 3/4 SRII Positive 
Displmt Meter

98.03 98.03 69.73 69.73 57.47 57.47 NO BID 62.6 62.6

5.1.12 1
1” SRII Positive Displmt 
Meter 159.25 159.25 126.7 126.7 120 120 NO BID 133.91 133.91

5.1.13 1 OMNI 3 V2 Tester
2637 2637 No Bid No Bid 2385 2385 NO BID 3350 3350

 
 

   
 

Discount % Off MSRP for Parts 15%

GRAND TOTAL

NO BID

 

$116,258.47 $109,827.51NO BID

25%

Product(s) do not 
meet specifications

40% 24%

$113,062.28 $49,205.88
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